
KAVIS Production Release 08/28/2025: 

Urgent- One Time Scripts = 25 completed 

Priority Stories:  

1. Web Renewal Reversal 

Description: With this functionality, users can now reverse web renewals. This is 
helpful to the clerks if a web renewal was done in mistake. A clerk can now reverse 
the transaction.  

2. MVL Report - Duplicate VIN Report  

Description: MVL users now have access to a report called ‘Duplicate VIN Title 
Report’. This report totals all the duplicate titles marked for extra review reason in 
Application/Active Status. This will come in an excel format and will be accessible in 
the Report Section in KAVIS.  

3. Web Renewal; Select All option to select all Web Renewals on a page 

Description: The KAVIS team was requested by many clerks for the ability to “Renew 
All” web renewals in the Web Renewal Queue to the Shopping Cart and check out. 
This functionality will give the clerks the ability to select all eligible web renewals in 
the queue to the shopping cart at once to checkout.  

The clerk will select   button in the Web Renewal Queue 
to perform the ‘Renew All’ action.  

4. Update Labels, Messages, Icons from Primary to 1st 

Description: This user story replace all language of a “Primary Owner” and 
“Secondary Owner” to “1st Owner”  and “2nd Owner” in KAVIS. This was requested by 
MVL so that there is no legal action taken. There is no mention of “Primary Owner” in 
statues instead it is phrased as “1st Owner”.  

5.  Customer Management - Allow FEIN Edit for Auto Dealers  

Description: This functionality provides MVL users the ability to edit FEIN for Dealer 
Customer Accounts in KAVIS. This will allow MVL to keep the most up-to-date 
information in KAVIS. This is a defaulted permission for “MVL Supervisor” and a 
selectable permission for “MVL Helpdesk”. MVL users can edit FEIN information 
under the Dealer Customer account within the ‘Edit’ functionality.  



6.  SLSPV - Update - Vehicle Type Correction 

Description: This functionality gives the clerks ability to perform an Update-Vehicle 
Type Correction for Off-road Vehicles without having to release or re-file liens. This 
should provide a solution for clerk to changes the Off-Road vehicles to the vehicle 
type Street Legal Special Purpose Vehicle.  

7.  PVA - Add McCracken County to the 88 file ftp job 

Description: This user stories provides McCracken County PVA their “88” report on 
an FTP server so they can pick it up for processing. This was requested by the 
McCracken County PVA.  


